Bid Tabulation Sheet

:‘_ Bid 2009-3-125
_ Police Uniforms
CITY OF ALLEN Opened7/13/09 @ 2pm GST Public Safety Supply
DESCRIPTION Qty Unit | Ext Price
1 |Blauer #8460 Short Sleeve Shirt 75/25 Poly Wool Color: 04 25 $ 5795 $ 1,448.75
2 |Blauer #8450 Long Sleeve Shirt 75/25 Poly Wool Color:04 25 $ 63.95 $ 1,598.75
3 |Blauer #8610-Z Short Sleeve Shirt 100% Poly Color: 04 75 $ 3295 $ 2,471.25
4 IBlauer #8600-Z Long Sleeve Shirt 100% Poly Color: 04 75 $ 36.95 $ 2,771.25
5 |Blauer #8600-Z Long Sleeve Shirt 100% Poly Color: 50 10 $ 3595 $ 359.50
6 |Blauer #8610-Z Short Sleeve Shirt 100% Poly Color: 50 10 $ 3195 $ 319.50
7 |Blauer #8400 Long Sleeve Shirt 55/45 Poly Wool Color:04 15 $ 63.95 $ 959.25
8 |Blauer #8410 Short Sleeve Shirt 55/45 Poly Wool Color:04 15 $ 56.95 $ 854.25
9 |Blauer #8431 Police Explorer Long Sleeve Shirt Color:46 10 $ 3395 $ 339.50
10 |Blauer #8900 Class "A' Uniform Long Sleeve Color: 26 2 $ 4995 $ 99.90
11 |Blauer #8135 B.Cool Polo Color: 04 12 $ 4695 $ 563.40
12 |Blauer #8130 B.Cool Polo Color:04 7 $ 48.95 $ 342.65
13 |Blauer #8132 Short Sleeve Knit Polo Shirt Color: All 12 $ 4795 $ 575.40
14 |Blauer #8650 Four Pocket Trousers 100% Poly Color:04 85 $ 3295 $ 2,800.75
15 |Blauer #8650W Four Pocket Womens Trouser 100% Poly Color:04 10 $ 3295 % 329.50
16 |Blauer #8560 Four Pocket Trousers 75/25 Poly Wool Color: 04 25 $ 66.95 $ 1,673.75
17 |Blauer #8560W Four Pocket Women's Trouser 75/25 Poly Wool Color:04 10 $ 66.95 $ 669.50
18 |Blauer # 8510 Four Pocket Trouser 55/45 Poly Wool Color: 04 15 $ 8195 $ 1,229.25
19 |Blauer #8510W Four Pocket Women's Trouser 55/45 Poly Wool Color:04 5 $ 8195 $ 409.75
20 |Blauer #8565 Side Pocket Trousers 75/25 Poly Wool Color:04 25 $ 7195 $ 1,798.75
21]Blauer #8565W Side Pocket Women's Trousers 75/25 Poly Wool Color:04 10 $ 7195 % 719.50
22|Blauer #8655 Side Pocket Trousers 100% Poly Color:04 25 $ 39.95 $ 998.75
23|Blauer #8655W Side Pocket Women's Trousers 100% Poly Color:04 10 $ 3995 $ 399.50
24 |Blauer #8650X Motorcycle Pants 100% Poly Color:04 5 $ 13795 $ 689.75
25|Blauer #8560X Motorcycle Pants 75/25 Poly Wool Color:04 5 $ 185.95 $ 929.75
26 |Blauer #9810Z Duty Jacket Cruiser with Pull Down Custom 5 $ 14595 $ 729.75
27 |Blauer #PD-330-P Lightweight Jacket 10 No Bid No Bid
28 |Blauer #9970-1 High Visibility Patrol Jacket 2 $ 319.95 $ 639.90
29 |Blauer #9860-10 TNT Bomber Jacket 2 $ 153.95 $ 307.90
30|Blauer #9845Z Emergency Jacket 1 3 24895 $ 248.95
31|Blauer #733-53-P2 Rain Coat 15 $ 13995 $ 2,099.25
32|Blauer #9972 Motorcycle Rain Pants 2 $ 188.95 $ 377.90
33|Blauer #9101-53 Uniform Cap Cover 10 $ 950 $ 95.00
| 34]|Bailey Uniform Hat 10 $ 3295 | $ 329.50




35|Wolfmark Uniform Neck Tie 14 1/2 Dark Navy 10 $ 59 $ 59.50
36]Wolfmark Uniform Neck Tie 18 Inch Dark Navy 10 $ 595 $ 59.50
37 |Wolfmark Uniform Neck tie 20 Inch Dark Navy 10 $ 595 $ 59.50
38| Wolfmark #001180 Class A-57 Tie Black 5 $ 595 $ 29.75
3915.11 #74003-190 Rip Stop TDU Pants Color: Green (XS-2XL) 10 $ 3995 % 399.50
40]5.11 #74003-190 Rip Stop TDU Pants Color: Green (3XL-4XL) 5 $ 4495 $ 224.75
4115.11 #74003-019 Rip Stop TDU Pants Color: Black (XS-2XL) 10 $ 39.95 $ 399.50
42]5.11 #74003-019 Rip Stop TDU Pants Color: Black (3XL-4XL) 5 $ 4495 $ 224.75
43]5.11 #74004 TDU Pants Color: Black 15 $ 3995 $ 599.25
4415.11 #74273-162 TDU Pants Color: Light 15 $ 3995 $ 599.25
45]5.11 #72002-190 Rip Stop TDU Long Sleeve Shirt Color: Green (S-2XL) 10 $ 4995 $ 499.50
46]5.11 #72002-190 Rip Stop TDU Long Sleeve Shirt Color: Green (3XL-4XL) 5 $ 5495 $ 274.75
4715.11 #72002-019 Rip Stop TDU Long Sleeve Shirt Color: Black (S-2XL) 10 $ 4995 $ 499.50
48]5.11 #72002-019 Rip Stop TDU Long Sleeve Shirt Color: Black (3XL-4XL) 5 $ 5495 $ 274.75
495.11 #41060-016 Short Sleeve Polo Shirt Color: All 10 $ 2995 $ 299.50
5015.11 #42056-016 Long Sleeve Polo Shirt Color: All 10 $ 39.95 $ 399.50
51|Propper #F5201 BDU Color: Green/Black 5 $ 2395 $ 119.75
52|Propper #F5454 BDU SWAT Blouse Colors: Green/Black 5 $ 2395 3 119.75
53 |Propper #F5420 M-65 SWAT Black Jacket with Liner 5) $ 55.95 $ 279.75
54|Propper #F520112001-L.3 BDU Pants (Recruits) Color: Black 10 $ 2395 % 239.50
55]Fechheimer #32278 Honor Guard Pants Color: Dark Navy 5 $ 7395 % 369.75
56]Fechheimer #32169 Honor Guard Ike Jacket Color: Dark Navy 2 $ 173.95  $ 347.90
57]Fechheimer #38800 Class "A" Men's Dress Coat Color: Dark Navy 2 $ 14595  $ 291.90
58| Fechheimer #38833 Class "A" Women's Dress Coat Color: Dark Navy 2 $ 13295 $ 265.90
59| Fechheimer #38200 Class "A" Men's Dress Pants Color: Dark Navy 2 $ 38.95 $ 77.90
60]Fechheimer #38233 Class "A" Women's Dress Pants Color: Dark Navy 2 $ 3895 $ 77.90
61|Dickies #874KH Pants Color: Khaki 5 $ 2095 $ 104.75
62| Dickies #574KH Long Sleeve Shirt Color: Khaki 5 $ 1895 $ 94.75
63| Dickies #1574KH Short Sleeve Shirt Color: Khaki 5 $ 1695 $ 84.75
64|Pro Tuff #PS02-1839 Long Sleeve BDU Shirt Color: Black 12 $ 5195 $ 623.40
65]Pro Tuff #PP02-1839 BDU Pants Color: Black 12 $ 6795 $ 815.40
66|Blauer #8842 Bike Patrol Shorts 7 $ 4995 $ 349.65
67]* Item 67 was a duplicate of Item 68 - See Item 68

68]Olympic OCP588-S Suplex Navy Bike Pants 7 $ 11495 $ 804.65




69]Olympic OCP588-W Water Proof Navy Bike Pants 7 $ 14595  $ 1,021.65
70]Olympic OMY673-S Suplex Royal Blue and Navy Bike Jacket 7 $ 17295  $ 1,210.65
71|Olympic OMY673-W Water Proof Royal Blue and Navy Bike Jacket 7 $ 22895 $ 1,602.65
72|Elbeco #ELB-E9614 Tac Cargo Women's Color: Navy 10 $ 5595 §$ 559.50
73|Elbeco #ELB-E614 Tac Cargo Men's Color: Navy 10 $ 5595 $ 559.50
74]|Elbeco #ELB-K5138 Polo Shirt Color: All Available 15 $ 2895 $ 434.25
75|Elbeco #ELB-K5140 Long Sleeve Polo Color: All Available 15 $ 3395 $ 509.25
76]Phenix Gear Gen Il Parka 5 No Bid No Bid

77|Phenix Gear Gen Il Pants 5 No Bid No Bid

| 78| Discount for Items not otherwise indicated 7%
[TOTAL BID PRICE $ 5109.90 $ 46,047.55 |

ALL BIDS SUBMITTED FOR THE DESIGNATED PROJECT ARE REFLECTED ON THIS SHEET. HOWEVER, THE LISTING OF A BIDDER ON THIS
SHEET SHOULD NOT BE CONSTRUED AS A COMMENT ON THE RESPONSIVENESS OF SUCH A BID OR AS ANY INDICATION THAT THE CITY
ACCEPTS SUCH BIDS AS RESPONSIVE. THE CITY WILL MAKE A DETERMINATION AS TO THE RESPONSIVENESS OF BIDS SUBMITTED BASED
UPON COMPLIANCE WITH ALL APPLICABLE LAWS, CITY OF ALLEN PURCHASING GUIDELINES AND PROJECT DOCUMENTS. INCLUDING BUT
NOT LIMITED TO THE PROJECT SPECIFICATIONS AND CONTRACT DOCUMENTS. THE CITY WILL NOTIFY THE SUCCESSFUL BIDDER UPON
AWARD OF THE CONTRACT AND ACCORDING TO LAW, ALL BIDS RECEIVED WILL BE AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION AT THAT TIME.
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