Bid Tabulation Sheet

:‘_ Bid 2009-3-126
_ Police Equipment

CITY OF ALLEN

Opened7/13/09 @ 2pm

GT Distributors

DESCRIPTION Qty Unit Ext Price
1]Safariland #70 - Basketweave - Duty Holster Glock 17/22 15 $ 97.00 $ 1,455.00
2|Safariland #6280 - Basketweave - Duty Holster with M-3 Light Glock 17/22 8 $ 88.50 $ 708.00
3|Safariland #38-4-4HS - Basketweave - Pepper Spray Holder 15 $ 1750 $ 262.50
4|Safariland #62-4HS - Basketweave - Hidden Snap Keepers 50 $ 550 $ 275.00
5|Safariland #77-83-4MHS - Basketweave - Double Magazine Pouch 15 $ 2262 $ 339.30
6]Safariland #87V - Basketweave - Duty Belt 15 $ 4324 $ 648.60
7]Safariland #99 - Inner Belt with velcro on one side 15 $ 2150 $ 322.50
8|Safariland #760-4 - Basketweave - Universal Radio Holder 15 $ 824 $ 123.60
9|Safariland #3904MHS - Basketweave - Handcuff Case 15 $ 2462 $ 369.30
10|Safariland #35-F26-4 Basketweave - Leather ASP Baton Holder 15 $ 1750 $ 262.50
11|Safariland #B-602B Brass Buckle for Duty Belt 20 $ 8.00 $ 160.00
12|Safariland #T21 Black Buckle for Honor Guard Belt 5 No Bid No Bid
13|Bianchi #17381 Nylon Duty Belt with Black Plastic Buckle 10 $ 26.00 $ 260.00
14]Bianchi #17390 Nylon Handcuff Case 4 $ 1350 $ 54.00
15|Bianchi #18521 Nylon Radio Holder 4 $ 21.24 $ 84.96
16|Bianchi #17446 Nylon Pepper Spray Holder 4 $ 13.00 $ 52.00
17|Bianchi #15635 Nylon Belt Keepers 40 $ 8.00 $ 320.00
18|Bianchi #18442 Nylon Magazine Holder 4 $ 1850 $ 74.00
19|Bianchi #22838 Nylon Holder for Stinger Flashlight 4 $ 750 $ 30.00
20]Bianchi #83-23222 Paddlelock Holster Color: Black or Tan 10 $ 4388 $ 438.80
21]Bianchi #B1-22113 Accumold Elite Radio Holder 25 $ 28.00 $ 700.00
22|Black Hawk #410500BK SERPA Holster (Right or Left) 10 $ 2450 $ 245.00
23|Fobus Magazine/Handcuff paddle holster #CU9G Color: Black 10 $ 1361 $ 136.10
24]Molded Nylon Duty Belt Item# NP238 4 $ 1288 $ 51.52
25|Molded Nylon 26" Expandable Baton Holder Item# B1-8013 4 $ 774 $ 30.96
26]Molded Nylon Handcuff Case Color: Black Item# B1-8000 4 $ 774 $ 30.96
27]Molded Nylon Double Staggered Mag Pouch Color: Black Item# B1-8002 4 $ 1212 $ 48.48
28|Uncle Mike's Slimline Pro 3 Cordura Triple Retention Duty Holster Color: Black 4 $ 4704 $ 188.16
29| Venture Bike Patrol Helmet 4 No Bid No Bid
30]3/4" Bike Helmet Decals, 3M Reflective "POLICE" 4 No Bid No Bid
31|De Santis #B21WL32Z0 Honor Guard White Belt 2 No Bid No Bid
32| De Santis #049WCB2Zo Honor Guard White Holster Rt Hand Glock 22 2 No Bid No Bid
33| De Santis #U01WJG1Z13 Honor Guard White Belt Keepers 8 No Bid No Bid
34|De Santis #U41WJJJZ3 Honor Guard White Magazine Pouches 2 No Bid No Bid




35]De Santis #U25WJG1Z3 Honor Guard White Handcuff Case 2 No Bid No Bid

36|Premier #P7012 Honor Guard Gloves 4 $ 263 $ 10.52
37]Premier #P5208 Honor Guard Ascot 2 $ 494 3% 9.88
38|Premier #P5404 Honor Guard Shoulder Cords 2 $ 844 $ 16.88
39|Premier #P5500 Honor Guard Single Strand Citation Cords 2 $ 844 % 16.88
40]Bates #2184 Honor Guard Paratrooper Side Zipper (Men) 2 $ 7353 % 147.06
41]|Bates #784 Honor Guard Paratrooper Side Zipper (Women) 2 $ 7353 $ 147.06
42|Rocky Hi-Gloss Oxfords # 510-3 2 No Bid No Bid

43|Dehner Top Strap Dress Instep Patrol Boot - Calfskin 2 No Bid No Bid

44]Premier #£1077 Mourning Band "Nemo Me Impune Lacessit" 15 $ 175 % 26.25
45|Premier #P4917 Traffic Whistle 25 $ 169 $ 42.25
46]Premier #P4922 Traffic Whistle Blue Cover 50 $ 188 $ 94.00
47 Premier #P303 Corporal chevrons for collar 10 $ 188 $ 18.80
48|Premier #P304 Sergeant chevrons for collar 10 $ 188 $ 18.80
49|Premier #P1300 Lieutenant bars for collar 10 $ 247  $ 24.70
50]Premier #P900 Lieutenant bars for coat shoulders 5 $ 247 % 12.35
51]Blackington #A1101 Instructor Motor Pin (Gold) 2 $ 947 % 18.94
52|Blackington #A1101 Motor Pin (Gold) 2 $ 947 $ 18.94
53|Blackington #A1101 Instructor Pin (Nickel) 2 $ 818 $ 16.36
54]Blackington #A1101 Motor Pin (Nickel) 5 $ 818 $ 40.90
55]Blackington #A1975 3/4" Lieutenant bars Hi Glo 2 $ 1159 $ 23.18
56]Blackington #A1973 3/4 " Captain bars Hi Glo 2 $ 1141 % 22.82
57]Blackington #A5697 3/4" Deputy Chief single star Hi Glo 2 $ 1588 $ 31.76
58|Blackington #A5697-3 3/4" Chief three star Hi Glo 2 $ 18.18  $ 36.36
59]Blackington #A1141 1" Lieutenant bars Hi Glo 2 $ 1335 $ 26.70
60|Blackington #A1140 1" Captain bars Hi Glo 2 $ 1582 $ 31.64
61|Blackington #A5211-A 1" Deputy Chief Single Star Hi Glo 2 $ 10.00 $ 20.00
62|Blackington #A5211-A3 1" Chief three stars Hi Glo 2 $ 18.18  $ 36.36
63|Blackington #J2 Name Tag Hi Glo with black letters 2 $ 6.89 $ 13.78
64]Gravograph #887622 Name Tag Silver or Gold 40 No Bid No Bid

65]Stream Light for Glock Item# STL-69110-TLR 1 LED 5 $ 87.30 $ 436.50
66|Stream Light #25103 Flashlight New LED 40 $ 7515 $ 3,006.00
67]Flashlight Battery for SL20XP Item# STL-25170 50 $ 28.89 $ 1,444.50
68|Flashlight Battery LED for SL20LED Item#STL-20175 50 $ 2889 $ 1,444.50




69]Flashlight 20XP Bulb Stream Light #201100 10 $ 1056 $ 105.60
70]Flashlight Yellow Traffic Cone ltem#STL-22519 40 $ 428 $ 171.20
71]1Smith and Wesson #350103 Handcuffs Model 100 15 $ 1896 $ 284.40
72| ASP #52611 Tactical Baton Black Chrome 10 $ 61.69 $ 616.90
73]JASP #7302 RED Training Guns 2 $ 3152 % 63.04
74]Pepper Spray 1.5 oz Item DT-43345 50 $ 965 $ 482.50
75|Blauer #342P Yellow Police Traffic Vest 10 No Bid No Bid
76]Point Blank Legacy Pro Ballistic Vest Leve 2 15 No Bid No Bid
77|Legacy Pro Il #R20D Red/Black Raid Vest Carriers 5 No Bid No Bid
78]Nylon Under Belt Size: All Item# 131-8105 12 $ 10.06 $ 120.72
79]Nylon Single Retention Holster for Automatics / Glock 22 (Lt or Rt) 17 $ 43.74  $ 743.58
80]Handcuff Key Item# SAV-HK10 20 $ 291 % 58.20
81|Blauer #200 Wooly Pully Sweaters 100% Wool Color: Black 5 No Bid No Bid
82)US Armor Enforcer Series Level 3A 3

82]Alternate - PTA - Rapid Response PT100 Molle 3 $ 1,062.50 $ 3,187.50
83| Tactical Ballistic Helmets - Gentex Model #GT-2000 Color Black 16

83|Alternate - PTA - 774B 16 $ 249.00 $ 3,984.00
84| Tactical Vests Battle Lab Model # V-PRED2-ZVA 16

84]Alternate - PTA -FAV2-701.2 16 $ 1,270.00 | $ 20,320.00
85| Ballistic Plates Battle Lab Model# CER-MEH 16

85]Alternate - PTA - PLT-111-SP-MC-10x12 16 $ 535.00 $ 8,560.00
86| Tactical Vest Attachment: YOKE BattleLab Model#A-PDYK-QVA3A 5

86]Alternate - PTA - PT700 - Yoke 5 $ 78750 $ 3,937.50
87| Tactical Vest Attachment: GROIN BattleLab Model# AW-CAT-NAPP 5

87]Alternate - PTA GROIN 5 $ 160.00 $ 800.00
88| Tactical Vest Attachment: BICEP BattleLab Model# AW-BSBP-QVA3A 5

88|Alternate - PTA - PT7- BICEPT 5 $ 27750 $ 1,387.50
89 Tactical Vest Attachment: LEG PLATFORM BattleLab Model #KIT-BLPF55 16

89|Alternate - PTA - Ballistic Chip - Left 16 $ 28250  $ 4,520.00
90] Tactical Vest Attachment: LEG ADAPTER BattleLab Model: BLPM55-3 16

90| Alternate - SAF - Molle Kit -2 16 $ 2644 $ 423.04
91]Tactical Vest Attachment: LOWER BACK ARMOR BattleLab Model# A-LBAT-QVA3A 16

91]Alternate - PTA - Tac Belt - PTA700 16 $ 10250 $ 1,640.00
92| Tactical Vest Attachment: TORSO SIDE PLATES BattleLab Model# AW-TSP-L 16

92]PTA-PLT-111-SP-SC-6x6 16 $ 24250 $ 3,880.00
93| Tactical Vest Attachment: FOREARM PROTECTORS BattleLab Model# AW-LSF-762 16 No Bid No Bid

94| Tactical Vest Attachment: WEAPONS CATCH 16

94]Alternate - BH-71CQDZBK 16 $ 28.13 ' $ 450.08
95|]Tactical Vest Attachment: FNDD POUCHES BattleLab Model# BLPM20-2 16




95]Alternate - PTA - MPS Six Pouch Set 16 $ 90.00 $ 1,440.00

96| Tactical Vest Attachments: ID PATCH PANEL BattleLab Model# BLPM39 16

96|Alternate - 38CL4Z 16 $ 999 $ 159.84

97]Goggles - Battle Lab Model# ESS010V-MLSC 16

97|Alternate - ESS02BK-T 16 $ 38.10 $ 609.60

98| Tactical Stretch Fit Baseball Cap - Under Armor - Color: All 6 $ 1438  $ 86.28

99|Heat Gear 5103 Tactical Hood - Under Armor 6 $ 1500 $ 90.00
100)StreamLight Weapon Light C4 LED - ST2-69110 6 $ 8730 $ 523.80
101|Rigger Belt All Sizes #BH-41CQO00BE 6 $ 2311 $ 138.66
102|Safariland ALS Level 11 w/ Ride UBL Model# 6360 6 $ 80.58 $ 483.48
103|Safariland ALS Tactical Holster Model# 6304 6 $ 11105 $ 666.30
104]Bianchi Patroltek Nylon Belt Keepers 4 pk Color: Black 6 $ 563 $ 33.78
105|Hatch Centurion Kneepads #KP250 6 $ 15.00 $ 90.00
106] Tactical Corner Zip Gear Bag - Blackhawk - 20CZ00BK 5 $ 56.86 $ 284.30
107]Operator Gloves SOG #SG-L600 Color: Black 5 $ 36.25 $ 181.25
108|SOG Operator CQB Gloves #S0OG-F10 5 $ 40.63 $ 203.15
109]Camelbak Storm 100 oz Hydration System Color: Foilage Green 5 $ 3094 $ 154.70
110]Hydration Pouch 100 oz #BH-38CL37 5 $ 2749 $ 137.45
111)General Purpose Uitility Pouch - Medium - #BH-38CL46 5 $ 23.74 ' $ 118.70
112|Radio Pouch PRC-112 #BH-38CL08 5 $ 26.24  $ 131.20
113|Single Pistol Mag Pouch 5 $ 10.61 $ 53.05
114]M4/M16 Single Open Top Mag Pouch 5 $ 1436 $ 71.80
115|Gas Mask Pouch 5 $ 2499 $ 124.95
116}Discount for items not otherwise indicated 8%

[TOTAL BID PRICE $ 7,221.02 $ 76,443.96 |

ALL BIDS SUBMITTED FOR THE DESIGNATED PROJECT ARE REFLECTED ON THIS SHEET. HOWEVER, THE LISTING OF A BIDDER ON THIS SHEET
SHOULD NOT BE CONSTRUED AS A COMMENT ON THE RESPONSIVENESS OF SUCH A BID OR AS ANY INDICATION THAT THE CITY ACCEPTS
SUCH BIDS AS RESPONSIVE. THE CITY WILL MAKE A DETERMINATION AS TO THE RESPONSIVENESS OF BIDS SUBMITTED BASED UPON
COMPLIANCE WITH ALL APPLICABLE LAWS, CITY OF ALLEN PURCHASING GUIDELINES AND PROJECT DOCUMENTS. INCLUDING BUT NOT
LIMITED TO THE PROJECT SPECIFICATIONS AND CONTRACT DOCUMENTS. THE CITY WILL NOTIFY THE SUCCESSFUL BIDDER UPON AWARD
OF THE CONTRACT AND ACCORDING TO LAW, ALL BIDS RECEIVED WILL BE AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION AT THAT TIME.
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